18-0120

PUBLIC USE OF WENGER BANDWAGON FORM
City Of Manitowoc - Parks Department

2655 S 35" Street, Manitowoc, WI 54220 o 920-686-3580

Basic pre-tax charges for the use of the bandwagon shall be $115.00 for one day and $50.00 for each
additional day. Fees are due at the time of application. In addition to these charges, any user of the
bandwagon shall also be billed for and required to pay all labor and equipment costs incurred by the
Parks Department to facilitate the rental of the band wagon (generally $500 for weekday
setup/takedown). Should any damages occur to the band wagon during its use, any such damages shall
be chargeable to the user above and beyond the charges provided for above.

Any organization using said bandwagon shall carry insurance in the amount of $100,000.00 liability for
injuries to any one person and not less than $300,000.00 liability for injuries from any one accident, and
in the sum of not less than $50,000.00 on account of any accident resulting in the destruction of or injury
to property, all with the condition that the parties will indemnify and hold harmless the City of
Manitowoc in any action resulting from the use thereof. The aforementioned insurance is to be approved
by the City Attorney.

All requests for the use of the bandwagon shall be made to the Manager of the Parks Department at least
seven days prior to the use of same, who will refer same to the Parks & Recreation Committee. Such
request may be granted by the Parks & Recreation Committee when said request does not interfere with
the scheduled use of the bandwagon or work program of the park crews.

The bandwagon shall not be removed from the City limits without the approval of the Parks &
Recreation Committee.

Resolution dated May 20, 1974, amended May 19, 1980

The following ﬂ[{t[[cﬂﬂgmm requests the use of the above bandwagon for
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I have read the above conditions, understand and agree to them
Date: _ Jin 22 2018 Signaturé
Printed name: M&z_g&z&&mkﬂﬂd

Address; 47 X

Phone: 20 755 219D

Approved Parks Manager or Designee

Denied Date:

4/ 5 Amount Due (Delivery rate + rental rafe plus extra hours, if applicable)
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Sandy Ronski

From: Denise Larson

Sent: Monday, January 22, 2018 2:06 PM
To: Sandy Ronski; Karen Dorow

Cc: Chad Scheinoha

Subject: FW: City Bandshell rental.
Attachments: City Stage Request.jpg

Not sure why it is coming to me, because I did give the park # to call for it. So here it is and when I receive the
hard copy Ill pass it along.

From: rodscheuer@charter.net [mailto:rodscheuer@charter.net]
Sent: Monday, January 22, 2018 1:56 PM

To: Denise Larson

Subject: City Bandshell rental.

Hi Denise. I also hard mailed you a copy of this request and figured it can't hurt to e-mail it to you as well. Let
me know if this will work. We rented the stage for several years but then lost it when we changed our dates to
the first week of August because that was the same weekend as Lakeshore Weekend for Kids. Now that they've
stopped having that event I'm hoping that we can again have usage of it. I completely understand that it's
required that the city employee guys set it up and take it down. I didn't look it up but I believe we were paying
something like $1100 in rental fees, which would be fine. We are fully insured by the Village of Mishicot. I'm
at 755-2190. Thank you!




