CITY OF MANITOWOC

WISCONSIN, USA

WwWw. manitowoc.org

July 16, 2020

Theodore Herrmann
1817 Lincoln Ave.
Two Rivers, WI 54241

RE: Snow Assessment Appeal
Dear Mr. Herrmann:

Your appeal for snow shoveling violation of February 21, 2020, at 1102 Waldo Blvd. was
heard by the Board of Public Works at their meeting of July 15, 2020. The Board unanimously

denied your request.

I am enclosing another copy of your invoice for said assessment which is due on
November 1, 2020. If not paid it will be included on the first installment of your 2020 property
tax bill.

Very truly yours,

Secretary, Board of Public Works

Enclosure

Deborah Neuser, CMC, City Clerk
CITY HALL - 900 Quay Street — Manitowoc, WI 54220-4543
Phone (920) 686-6950 — Fax (920) 686-6959 — dneuser@manitowoc.org



CITY OF MANITOWOC

900 QUAY ST.
MANITOWOC, WISCONSIN 54220
www. manitowoc.org
INVOICE
02/28/2020

HERRMANN, THEODORE
1817 LINCOLN AVE
TWO RIVERS, WI 54241
Due Date: November 1, 2020
PR : o T .ﬁ:i—;“‘,",'.i'f_':;:{gﬂ‘,’ i".:‘,""-'i—_“: u 2 VE e A
Parcel #: 360-000-012 7$300.00

Customer #: 35961
Assessment ID#: SS2020-0116

Snow Shoveling Violation
Date Shoveled: 2/21/2020

1102 WALDO BLVD

This is your notice that a special charge/assessment has been made against the above described
lot in the City of Manitowoc in accordance with the Municipal Code and WI State Statutes.
Payment may be made at the office of the Manitowoc City Treasurer. If the amount above is not
paid by November 1 of the current year, the full amount will be included on the 1* installment of
your next property tax bill.

If you have questions regarding the invoice, please call (920) 686-6950.

Please detach and remit with payment

——-._—————-—.—————--———-—————-————n———————--———-————-

HERRMANN,THEODORE

S/A: $52020-0116 Due: November 1, 2020
Parcel: 360-000-012 Amount Due: $300.00
Customer #: 35961

Amount Paid $
Remit to: '
City of Manitowoc
900 Quay Street
Manitowoc, WI 54220
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Deborah Neuser

From: Sue Reilly

Sent: Monday, June 1, 2020 6:40 AM

To: Deborah Neuser; Mackenzie Reed-Kadow
Subject: FW: CITY OF MANITOWOC TEST

This is the gtfy who came to the meeting and was not on the agenda. Mackenzie printed off the pictures and it was
somewhat discussed (as per the complainant).

From: Ted Herrmann [mailto:xtserio@gmail.com]
Sent: Friday, May 29, 2020 8:38 AM

To: Sue Reilly

Cc: xtserio@gmail.com

Subject: RE: CITY OF MANITOWOC TEST

Hello Sue Reilly, h”
AB¥

Subject:

Assessment ID # $52020-01116 0\9—%%9;;50\
6 |

Parcel: 360-000-012
Customer # 35961

You have photos on file, | have copies from you.

| have been assessed $ 300.00 for Snow Shoveling Viola*i-
From your document, Date Shoveled: 02/21/2020 f > 09
0§25

| would please ask that this assessment be rescinded 3\ \q- \Q{;'r

Here are the facts: W\LSS&%

This was the second major snow fall of the season.
Looking at the pictures you can see that from the heigh.. ui the snow banks that the snow was removed from the first

snow fall.
From the pictures you can see that the area in question was passable.

The sun is going down as you can see from these pictures.

| worked until just about dark on 02/21/2020 and went to my property to shovel.
It was not shoveled when | arrived and | did shovel.

| had no knowledge of any complaint or these pictures.
This is what | do know. | shoveled this area.

Please consider if $ 300.00 is in anyway a fair assessment for this violation.
If someone was to be hired to remove the amount of snow in question, would the cost be $ 300.00.

Please rescind this assessment.



Sue Reilly, please notify me by phone only in advance at least by 24 hours as to when this will be taken up by your
committee.
I would like to attend the meeting.

Thank you.
Best Regards,
Ted Herrmann

Contact information:
Home Phone: 920-682-5909
Cell Phone:920-794-8830

From: Sue Reilly [mailto:sreilly@manitowoc.org]
Sent: Thursday, May 28, 2020 9:18 AM

To: 'xtserio@gmail.com’

Subject: CITY OF MANITOWOC TEST

Sue Reilly

City of Manitowoc DP}
Administrative Support Specialist
Streets & Sanitation, Parks,
Cemetery, Buildings & Grounds
Office: {920)686-6550

Fax: (920)686-6525

Shop: {920)686-6526



10122
City of Manitowoc

Department of Public Infrastructure

Sidewalk snow removal violation and removal form

Location: 1102 WALDO BLVD Complaint Date: 2/20/2020 12:00:00 AM
Parcel Number: 360000012 (Lot #6475) Complainant Name:
Owner Name: HERRMANN, THEODORE (Cust #35961) Complainant Phone:
Owner Address: 1817 LINCOLN AVE TWO RIVERS, W1 54241 Subsequent Complaint (circle if applicable)
If circled proceed to 2™ inspection and removal

Initial inspection date: 02-19-2020 | Inspector: BH

Action taken: (circle one) GIVEN TO CONTRACTOR

Date issue given to contractor: 02-20-2020
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SHOVELED
2-2(-3.0 No mm Jm | [Hr So0 | 3B0gs
~ lofioy
CIS C:\Users\Ihoffman\AppData\Local\Temp\CM20200220048210.sbw  2/20/2020 % g

QR









