From: Carol A. Mielke

To: Mackenzie Reed

Subject: FW: External: Lot purchased from City of Manitowoc 3304 Mero St.
Date: Monday, January 27, 2025 12:35:15 PM

Attachments: MANITOWOC. WI 54220 2.pdf

CITY OF MANITOWOC mowing fine.pdf
image001.png

Mackenzie —

Please see the email below that | received.
Do these go to you?

Please let me know if | need to do anything.

Thank you,

Carol Mielke

Administrative Support Specialist — DPI
City of Manitowoc

900 Quay St

Manitowoc, W1 54220

920-686-6510

cmielke@manitowoc.org

From: Rachel Johnson <racheljfs12 @yahoo.com>

Sent: Sunday, January 26, 2025 10:47 AM

To: Carol A. Mielke <cmielke@manitowoc.org>

Subject: External: Lot purchased from City of Manitowoc 3304 Mero St.

Dear Carol, & to whom it may concern,

| would like to ask that you, or perhaps someone who has oversight of this area, hear me out
regarding a recent lot purchase that my husband and | made on 4/12/24. It is the lot located at 3304
Mero St. We purchased this lot from Manitowoc County in the City of Manitowoc, however exactly
one month from the purchase of this lot we got a $300 mowing fine from the City of Manitowoc.

This seemed peculiar to us since at purchase we determined upon seeing the lot that it needed
extensive lawn care and we were in the process of making arrangements to do so. We do not live in
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CITY OF MANITOWOC TREASURER MANITOWOC COUNTY - STATE OF WISCONSIN

900 QUAY ST PROPERTY TAX BILL FOR 2024

MANITOWOC, WI 54220 REAL ESTATE
JOHNSON, PETER
JOHNSON, RACHEL L

Parcel Number: 220017070

OO 0O 0 0 0 Bill Number: 119800

Important: Be sure this description covers your
property. Note that this description is for tax bill
only and may not be a full legal description. See

1 19800/220017070 reverse side for important information.
PETER JOHNSON Location of Property/Legal Description
RACHEL L JOHNSON MERO ST

3050 ANDERBERG DR #9 CUSTERDALE SUB '
FITCHBURG W1 53731 CUSTERDALE SUBD LOT(.)-IN%L:\\("[ZES

Please inform treasurer of address changes.

ASSE-SEEDNS’MW !l\flsptsg\ﬂg\\{;\l.g TOTA\II. asggssm A\'PRARf% gssxrr NVE:L ts%siiséo NET PROPERTY TAX %0
| 0 0 0 0.911900920 0.01779082 Weed Cutting 300 00
* (Does NOT reflect credits)
ESTIMATED FAIR MARKET ESTIMATED FAIR MARKET TOTAL ESTIMATED  Astarinths | School taxes also reduced
VALUE LAND VALUE IMPROVEMENTS FAIR MARKET VALUE E s by school levy tax credit
0 0 0 unpaid prior 0.00
year taxes
1
) 2023 2024
EST STATE AIDS EST STATE AIDS 2023 2024 % TAX
TAXING JURISDICTION ALLOCATED TAX DIST ALLOCATED TAX DIST NET TAX NET TAX CHANGE
MANITOWOC COUNTY 3.026.886 2.994 496 49.73 0.00 -100.0%
CITY OF MANITOWOC 9.354,977 9.735.401 85.23 0.00 -100.0%
SCH D OF MANITOWOC 36.295.016 38.643.080 72.22 0.00 -100.0%
LAKESHORE TECH 2.341.905 2.271,635 7.47 0.00 -100.0%
COLLEGE
TOTAL 51,018,784 53,644,612 214.65 0.00 -100.0% |TOTALDUE:$300.00
FORFULL PAYMENT,PAYTO LOCAL
TREASURER BY:
JANUARY 31, 2025
Waming: If n%t paid by due dates,
FIRST DOLLAR CREDIT 0.00 0.00 0.0% instaliment option Is lost and total tax is
LOTTERY AND GAMING CREDIT 0.00 0.00 0.0% | Selnauent suojet tontrest an.
NET PROPERTY TAX 214.65 0.00 -100.0% Failure to pay on time. See reverse.
FOR INFORMATION PURPOSES ONLY ¢ Voter Approved Temporary Tax Increases
Total Additional Total Additional Taxes Year Increase Total Addinonal Total Additional Taxes Year Increase
Taxing Junsdicton Taxes Applied to Property Ends Taxing Junisdiction Taxes Applied to Property Ends
SCH D OF MANITOWOC 8 354,794 0.00 2028
———————————————— [ e e ey e e el S dirmadhenad g ool e ap -t e eyt (e et e Ardhaasie e bt e
PAY IN FULL $300 00 | 2ND INSTALLMENT: $0.00 | 3RD INSTALLMENT $0.00 | 4TH INSTALLMENT: $0.00
or IST INSTALLMENT: $300.00 | l I
BY JANUARY 31, 2025 : BY MARCH 31, 2025 : BY MAY 31, 2025 : BY JULY 31,2025
AMOUNT ENCLOSED | AMOUNT ENCLOSED | AMOUNT ENCLOSED | AMOUNT ENCLOSED ‘
MAKE CHECK PAYABLE AND MAIL TO: : MAKE CHECK PAYABLE AND MAIL TO: : MAKE CHECK PAYABLE AND MAIL TO: : MAKE CHECK PAYABLE AND MAIL TO:
| l
CITY OF MANITOWOC TREASURER : CITY OF MANITOWOC TREASURER | CITY OF MANITOWOC TREASURER | CITY OF MANITOWOC TREASURER
900 QUAY ST | 900 QUAY ST | 900 QUAY ST | 900 QUAY ST
MANITOWOC, WI 54220 | MANITOWOC, W1 54220 | MANITOWOC, W1 54220 | MANITOWOC, W1 54220
PIN# 220017070 | ping 220017070 | pin# 220017070 | ping 220017070
JOHNSON, PETER | JOHNSON, PETER | JOHNSON, PETER | JOHNSON, PETER
BILL NUMBER: 119800 | BILL NUMBER: 119800 : BILL NUMBER: 119800 : BILL NUMBER: 119800
: | .
I | |
| | I
||||l|||llllllll||||||llllllllll||||||||||||l||||\|||||| ||||||||||||||||||||||||||||||l|||||||||||||l||||||||||| 0O O RIS OO 0 O A
|

INCLUDE STUB WITH YOUR PAYMENT INCLUDE STUB WITH YOUR PAYMENT INCLUDE STUB WITH YOUR PAYMENT INCLUDE STUB WITH YOUR PAYMENT







CITY OF MANITOWOC

900 QUAY ST.

MANITOWOC, WISCONSIN 54220
WWW.manitowoc.org

INVOICE

05/14/2024

JOHNSON, PETER
3050 ANDERBERG DRIVE #9 N
FITCHBERG, WI 53731

Due Date: Upon Receipt

Parcel #: 220-017-070 $300.00

Customer #: 55207
Assessment ID#: WC2024-0004

Weed Cutting Violation
DATE CUT: 05/12/2024

3304 MERO ST

This is your notice that a special charge/assessment has been made against the above describec
lot in the City of Manitowoc in accordance with the Municipal Code and W1 State Statutes.
Payment may be made at the office of the Manitowoc City Treasurer. If the amount above 1s nt
paid by November 1 of the current year, the full amount will be included on the 1* installment ¢

your next property tax bill.

If you have questions regarding the invoice, please call (920) 686-6510.

Please detach and remit with payment

JOHNSON, PETER o

S/A: W(C2024-0004 Due: Upon Receipt
Parcel: 220-017-070 Amount Due: $300.00

Customer #: 55207
Amount Paid $

Remit to:
City of Manitowoc
900 Quay Street
Manitowoc, W1 54220
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Manitowoc and had arranged for my niece, who lives right in town, to mow the lawn over the
summer. She went over to mow the lot on 5/13/24 and saw the notice of mowing fine that was
staked on the property just a couple days before!!

In light of these details, we think it is unfair that the City of Manitowoc fine us for lawn care such a
short time after we purchased a lot from Manitowoc county that was under the care of the City of

Manitowoc.

Since these events, we have done extensive lawn care to this property and have kept up on the
mowing and snow removal. This should attest to our intent to care for this property.

Our question is; would you kindly consider remitting this fine, or perhaps reducing it?

Thank you for your consideration in this matter.
If you would like to reach out to me with further questions, my phone number is 608-279-7944

Sincerely,
Rachel Johnson

For reference:
| have attached copies of the invoice/fine/pictures, & tax bill showing the fine.

Be Alert !

This is External or System generated Email. Please verify before opening any links or attachments.



