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Request Type: |Unbudgeted |

Department: IMayors Office |  Date: [11/30/2016 |

Title of Request:  [Ships Wheel |

Department Priority  [Desirable

Linked to another O Yes
project?
@ No

Project Request is: (&) New Estimated Useful Life: (40

(O Replacement
(O Modification

This is a limited field, please attach documents for more detail,

Description: [Installation of ships wheel monument at Marina
Basis of Cost: O Quote Total Cost  {$5,000.00
QO Bid
(® Estimate
Revenue (if any)  [$0.00 |  NetCost [$5,000.00 |

Will there be additional costs in future years to complete this project?

select one: O Yes If yes, amount? | |

® No

Finance: Account |

Sendto Department [ ] Date: | ]




Chad Scheinoha

. L _______________________________________________J
To: pizmcmp@sbcglobal.net

Subject: FW: Ships wheel monument

Hello Erich,

The Mayor has asked me to submit this to our Capital Allocation Group for approval. | have submitted for the amount of
$5,000.00. We meet in a couple weeks and | will let you know the status after that meeting. Here is what the funding
would cover. | estimated high to make sure we have enough. Labor should be less.

Updated Labor Quote $3,000.00
Concrete and Rebar $1,240.00
Landscaping $260.00
Plaque $500.00
Chad J. Scheinoha

City of Manitowoc, Dept. of Public Infrastructure
(Park, Cemetery, Lift Bridge and Electrical Operations)
Mobile (920)374-0402

Office (920)686-6512

www.manitowoc.org

From: Chad Scheinoha

Sent: Thursday, October 20, 2016 6:33 AM
To: 'pitzmcmp@sbcglobal.net’

Subject: FW: Ships wheel monument

Eric,

Here is the last project/cost breakdown that | had. Note the highlighted. These were number from almost a year ago,
so they may have increased some?

Also the plague and mounting will be a bit. {$500)?

Let me know what you think. | can’t spend any money on this unless you can get to the Mayor or council for some. That
is all we would be waiting for to put it in. All other approvals are done. Most donated projects that | have been working
on like this are fully funded by donors and not the city.

Chad J. Scheinoha

City of Manitowoc, Dept. of Public Infrastructure
(Park, Cemetery, Lift Bridge and Electrical Operations)
Mobile (920)374-0402

Office (920)686-6512

www.manitowoc.org

From: Chad Schelncha
Sent: Wednesday, January 07, 2015 2:39 PM



To: pizmemp@sheglobal.net
Cc: Dan Koski

Subject: Ships wheel monument

Hello Erich,

| wanted to give you an update on the ships wheel monument. Here is what | have so far. Take a look and see if you
think that | am missing anything. TJ Seiler was the cheapest 1 found for concrete, unless you made any progress with
Martell. | also talked with Irv Seiler and Vinton. ‘ i 7 ]

One hurdle that we need to get past first though is covering the cost. Initially | thought that we could cover the concrete
and steel, however the council ended up approving it with using zero budgeted city funds. So we need to know who will
cover the cost of the materials and T)'s labor before we can start. | would suggest using your industry contacts and sell
spots on the plaque for names of people or businesses. Maybe $1,000 for 2” letters, $500 for 1” and $250 for 4", this is
just a thought? | can’t commit too much time to this, even though | would like to. | have permission from my boss and
the mayor to help you get it up, but to spend minimal time on it. iIf | can make any contacts through daily ops | will try to
help get more donors. As soon as we agree that all areas are covered we should start setting some dates for work to
start.

Excavating and site prep: Kip Gulseth total donation(no charge)

Concrete work/labor T) Seiler $2,000.00, he will donate $700 and we will need to
pay him $1300.00

Aggregate material City $0

Concrete: city supplier $455.00

Steel rebar city supplier $785.00

Fabricate Steel A-Frame McMullen and Pitz/Bay Ship  donation{l think)

Transport and set Wheel McMullen and Pitz donation(! think)

Landscaping 7? 7?7

Site plaque Manitowoc Trophy $??

Let me know what you think and we can touch base over the next month or so.

Chad J. Scheinoha

Parks — Cemetery — Bridges

City of Manitowoc, Department of Public Infrastructure
(920) 686-6512

(920) 374-0402






