Sonja Birr

From: Sandy Ronski

Sent: Friday, January 24, 2014 8:22 AM

To: Dan Koski

Cc: Sonja Birr; Chad Scheinoha; Karen Dorow

Subject: Letter from Priscilla Schroeder re: disinterment fee

Attachments: Schroeder, Priscilla 11-25-13.PDF; Schroeder fee documents 11-13.PDF

I am not sure who takes care of getting this on the next agenda for the Public Infrastructure Committee, but I've
attached the letter from Priscilla Schroeder requesting the refund of % of the disinterment fees for disinterring her two
babies, Luke & Sarah Schroeder, who were buried on the same space. Last night, the Cemetery Commission
recommended granting the request.

Thank you,

Sandy Ronski

Cemetery/Parks/Transit/Streets & Sanitation Depts.
City of Manitowoc

2655 S 35th St

Manitowoc, WI 54220

920-686-6518

920-686-6525 fax

www.manitowoc.org




Priscilla Schroeder
1316 Armond Ct.
De Pere, WI 54115
(920)336-9325

November 21,2013 -
Evergreen Cemetery
2655 South 35t Street
Manitowoc, W1 54220

To Whom It May Concern,

Recently, | lost my husband and decided to move our babies, who were buried at
Evergreen Cemetery, to Green Bay to be with their father. | was told that your fee
would be $500 for opening their gravesite.

When | got the final cost of your fee | was taken back that it was $1,000. This is
overpriced to me, since the babies were together in the same plot being only inches -
apart. One casket is 3 %'x2'x14” and the other is only 16”x8”x6".

| would appreciate your consideration to reimburse me the difference of $500 as it

seems a fair and usual cost for one plot. Again, | am not dealing with two plots. Please
call me at 920-336-9325 if you have any questions. Thank you.

Sincerely,

Priscilla Schroeder
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Cotter Funeral Homa §20-335-8702
860 N. Webster Avenue, De Pere, WI 54115

KMUTSON/COTTER FUNERAL HOME 920—8%33—241 1
535 County Read R, PO Box 655, Denmark, WIl 54208

DEWANE/COTTER FUNERAL HOME 920-53:24366
711 Main Slreet, PO Box 351, Wrightstown, Wi f54180

i

. To: Evergreen Cemetery

COTTER FUMERSL HOMES PaG

Cotter Funeral Homes

From: Matt Cotter

Fax: 9206866525

Pages: 3 (inc cover)

Phone:

Date:  10/9/2013

Re: Schroeder diginterments

CC:

1 Urgent [ For Review [0 Pleass Comment [ Plaaze Raply O Flease Recycle

® Notes/Commuents

Please fill out and sign the hottom section of both permit applications, and fax back to me at 920-336-
2150 when ready. Please also forward (olal charges for the 2 interments as wed!,

It

Matt Cotter
920-336-8702 .




FAX COVER SHEET

; MANITOWOC # @ |
To: % %g// Date: /p //d’/g
Company: Time:
Fax N Pages: 3 Including Cover Sheet

o
From: M V Re:

If you have any questions regarding this fax, or did not receive the num-
ber of pages indicated, please call the person above.
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