22-0638

'Greg Minikel

From: Matt Smits

Sent: Wednesday, July 27, 2022 11:03 AM
To: 'Mike Pappathopoulos'; Greg Minikel
Ce: Lynn Hoffman; Paul Braun; Adam Tegen
Subject: RE: External: Color Craft
Attachments: 7795C2.0_02-22-22 pdf

Yes Mike to extend the driveway a new driveway permit will cost $40. It should be noted that you would need
permission to make the driveway larger then 35", | found an old plan you sent me showing the driveway off of | Tech
and that you want to make it 70" wide. Greg will take this to the Committee next week to get permission.

Attached is the plan you sent me dated February 22, 2022. Do you have a more current version?

From: Mike Pappathopoulos <mikep@hamann.com>

Sent: Wednesday, July 27, 2022 9:42 AM

To: Matt Smits <msmits@manitowoc.org>; Lynn Hoffman <lhoffman@manitowoc.org>; Paul Braun
<PBraun@manitowoc.org>; Adam Tegen <ategen@manitowoc.org>

Subject: External: Color Craft

Well, then | would like to get that one permit (540?) when | stop in with payment for the local early start.

Michael Pappathopoulos
HAMANN

CONITRUCTION COMPANTY

Phone: 920-682-8282
Fax: 920-683-3459
www.hamann.com
mikep@hamann.com

From: Matt Smits <msmits@manitowoc.org>

Sent: Wednesday, July 27, 2022 8:45 AM

To: Mike Pappathopoulos <mikep@hamann.com>; Lynn Hoffman <lhoffman@manitowoc.org>; Paul Braun
<PBraun@manitowoc.org>; Adam Tegen <ategen@manitowoc.org>

Subject: RE: External: RE: Manitowoc Tool & Mfg

Yes if you are doing driveway work in the right of way you need a permit.

From: Mike Pappathopoulos <mikep@hamann.com>

Sent: Wednesday, July 27, 2022 8:35 AM

To: Lynn Hoffman <lhoffman@manitowoc.org>; Matt Smits <msmits@manitowoc.org>; Paul Braun
<PBraun@manitowoc.org>; Adam Tegen <ategen@manitowoc.org>

Subject: RE: External: RE: Manitowoc Tool & Mfg

Please confirm if the new driveway/sidewalk permit is needed to expand the existing truck driveway at Color Craft per
the plans?

Michael Pappathopoulos



HamANN

———
CONSTAUCTION COMPANY

Phone: 920-682-8282
Fax: 920-683-3459
www.hamann.com
mikep@hamann.com

From: Lynn Hoffman <lhoffman@manitowoc.org>

Sent: Monday, July 11, 2022 8:16 AM

To: Mike Pappathopoulos <mikep@hamann.com>; Matt Smits <msmits@manitowoc.org>; Paul Braun
<PBraun@manitowoc.org>; Adam Tegen <ategen@manitowoc.org>

Subject: RE: External: RE: Manitowoc Tool & Mfg

The cost for the New Driveway/Sidewalk permit is $40.00
Thank you,

Lynn

Lg WA H'Oﬁfmﬁw

City of Manitowoc

Department of Engineering
Adwmintstrative Support Spectalist
920-686-6910

c\Y Of

‘i/ OCJ
IN;roW

From: Mike Pappathopoulos <mikep@hamann.com>

Sent: Friday, July 8, 2022 2:31 PM

To: Matt Smits <msmits@manitowoc.org>; Paul Braun <PBraun@manitowoc.org>; Adam Tegen
<ategen@manitowoc.org>

Cc: Lynn Hoffman <lhoffman@manitowoc.org>

Subject: RE: External: RE: Manitowoc Tool & Mfg

How much is that for the sidewalk driveway permit?

| just got an invoice from Lisa for the local early start so | am trying to get all the totals and bring along all the checks.

Michael Pappathopoulos
HAMANH

——— s
CONITALCTION COMFANT

Phone: 920-682-8282



_Fax: 920-683-3459
www.hamann.com
mikep@hamann.com

From: Matt Smits <msmits@manitowoc.org>

Sent: Monday, June 27, 2022 6:22 AM

To: Mike Pappathopoulos <mikep@hamann.com>; Paul Braun <PBraun@manitowoc.org>; Adam Tegen
<atepen@manitowoc.org>

Cc: Lynn Hoffman <lhoffman@manitowoc.org>

Subject: RE: External: RE: Manitowoc Tool & Mfg

That would be a sidewalk driveway permit.
Right of way excavation permit is needed for the utility connections in the right of way.

From: Mike Pappathopoulos <mikep@hamann.com>

Sent: Friday, June 24, 2022 10:27 AM

To: Paul Braun <PBraun@manitowoc.org>; Adam Tegen <ategen@manitowoc.org>; Matt Smits
<msmits@manitowoc.org>

Subject: External: RE: Manitowoc Tool & Mfg

Do we need a right of way permit to do the curb cuts and pour the driveway aprons?

Michael Pappathopoulos
HAMANN

e
CONITALC TION COMPANT

Phone; 920-682-8282
Fax: 920-683-3459
www.hamann.com
mikep@hamann.com

From: Mike Pappathopoulos

Sent: Friday, June 24, 2022 10:10 AM

To: Paul Braun <pbraun@manitowoc.org>; Adam Tegen <ategen@manitowoc.org>; Matt Smits
<msmits@manitowoc.org>

Subject: FW: Manitowoc Tool & Mfg

Attached are the newest site plans.

Michael Pappathopoulos
HAMANN

T
COMSTALUCTION COMPANY

Phone: 920-682-8282
Fax: 920-683-3459
www.hamann.com
mikep@hamann.com

From: Calvin Tollefson <ctollefson@harrisinc.net>

Sent: Friday, June 24, 2022 9:43 AM

To: Mike Pappathopoulos <mikep@hamann.com>; Tim Hephner <thephner@hamann.com>
Cc: Bob Tollefson <btollefson@harrisinc.net>

Subject: Manitowoc Tool & Mfg

Attached are pdf's of the revised civil plans. The asphalt edge is moved to the south. | have to send the contractor the
cad files so | will copy Mike on that e-mail.
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