Capital Project Request Form

.. Manitowoc //cocorcacec

Request Type: |Unbudgeted |

Department: [Manitowoc Fire Rescue |  Date: [07/15/2022 |

Title of Request: [LP-15 Cardiac Monitor/Defib - (An Ambulance is w/o a cardiac monitor) |

Department Priority  [Mandated |

Linked to another () Yes
project? O
No

Project Requestis: () New Estimated Useful Life: |10

(O Replacement
(O Modification

This is a limited field, please attach documents for more detail.

Description: |Replaces LP12 no longer supported. Monitor is currently Out of Service.
Basis of Cost: O Quote Total Cost  {$39,621.29
O Bid
O Estimate
Revenue (if any) | |  NetCost [$39,621.29 |

Will there be additional costs in future years to complete this project?

select one: O Yes If yes, amount? | |
O No
Finance Dept: Account | | Sent to Dept:  []

Action: | |




Kim Lynch

From: Kim Lynch

Sent: Friday, July 15, 2022 11:36 AM

To: Todd Blaser; Nick Reimer; Greg Vadney; Adam Tegen; Kim Lynch; Dan Koski; Jeremy Walvoord

Subject: FW: CAWG EOL Request

Attachments: EOL 2022 Request LP-15.pdf; LP-15 Replacement Cost.pdf

Tracking: Recipient Response
Todd Blaser Approve: 7/15/2022 2:52 PM
Nick Reimer Approve: 7/15/2022 12:13 PM
Greg Vadney
Adam Tegen Approve: 7/18/2022 10:22 AM
Kim Lynch Approve: 7/15/2022 11:40 AM
Dan Koski Approve: 7/15/2022 11:39 AM
Jeremy Walvoord Approve: 7/15/2022 11:42 AM

Please use voting buttons above.

This is actually going to be an Unbudgeted request. We were going to add it to the EOL list for 2023, however the unit
needs immediate replacing, but has not been list as EOL, so it is not eligible for that process.

This will need to go to Public Safety and Finance.

Kim Lynch | Comptroller/Deputy Treasurer & Interim Finance Director
City of Manitowoc

900 Quay Street

Manitowoc, WI 54220

(920) 686-6962
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From: Todd Blaser <tblaser@manitowoc.org>
Sent: Friday, July 15, 2022 11:16 AM

To: Kim Lynch <klynch@manitowoc.org>
Subject: RE: EOL Request

If we could do now it would be best.

1. Price currently
2. We have a ambulance currently without a cardiac monitor.

Thank you,



Todd M. Blaser, Chief of Fire Rescue
Manitowoc Fire Rescue Department
900 Quay Street

Manitowoc Wisconsin 54220

Phone: 686-6540

Fax: 686-6545

This message is intended exclusively for the individual or entity to which it is addressed. This communication may contain
information that is proprietary, privileged, or confidential. If you are not the named addressee, you are not authorized to
read, print, retain, copy, or disseminate this message or any part of it. Any further disclosure of this information is legally
prohibited and subject to liability. If you have received this message in error, please notify the sender immediately by e-
mail, phone or fax and delete all copies of this message

From: Kim Lynch

Sent: Friday, July 15, 2022 11:15 AM

To: Todd Blaser <tblaser@manitowoc.org>
Subject: RE: EOL Request

Thanks! One question, can we list this for 2023 and purchase in January or is this something we need now?

Kim Lynch | Comptroller/Deputy Treasurer & Interim Finance Director
City of Manitowoc

900 Quay Street

Manitowoc, WI 54220

(920) 686-6962
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From: Todd Blaser <tblaser@manitowoc.org>
Sent: Friday, July 15, 2022 11:12 AM

To: Kim Lynch <klynch@manitowoc.org>
Subject: EOL Request

Kim,
The above attachments are for the LP12 that is currently out of service because we can no longer have it serviced.

Thank you,



Todd

Todd M. Blaser, Chief of Fire Rescue
Manitowoc Fire Rescue Department
900 Quay Street

Manitowoc Wisconsin 54220

Phone: 686-6540

Fax: 686-6545

This message is intended exclusively for the individual or entity to which it is addressed. This communication may contain
information that is proprietary, privileged, or confidential. If you are not the named addressee, you are not authorized to
read, print, retain, copy, or disseminate this message or any part of it. Any further disclosure of this information is legally

prohibited and subject to liability. If you have received this message in error, please notify the sender immediately by e-
mail, phone or fax and delete all copies of this message



stryker

LP15

Quote Number:

Version:

Prepared For:

Quote Date:

Expiration Date:

10499198

1
MANITOWOQC FIRE DEPT
Attn:

06/07/2022
09/05/2022

Delivery Address

Name: MANITOWOC FIRE DEPT

Account #: 1168559

Address: 900 QUAY ST
MANITOWQC

Wisconsin 54220-4543

Equipment Products:
# Product
1.0 99577-001957

Description
LIFEPAK 15 V4 Monitor/Defib - Manual & AED, Trending,

Remit to:

Rep:
Email:
Phone Number:

Mabile:

End User - Shipping - Billing

Name: MANITOWOC FIRE DEPT

Account #: 1168559

Address: 900 QUAY sT
MANITOWOC

Wisconsin 54220-4543

2.0 41577-000288

3.0 21330-001176
4.0 11140-000098
5.0 11140-000015
6.0 11140-000080
7.0 11171-000082
8.0 11171-000049

9.0 21300-008159
10.0 11160-000011
11.0 11160-000013
12.0 11160-000017
13.0 11160-000019

Noninvasive Pacing, Sp02, SpCO, NIBP, 12-Lead ECG,
EtCO2, BT. Incl at N/C: 2 pr QC Electrodes
(11996-000091) & 1 Test Load (21330-001365) per
device, 1 Svc Manual CD (26500-003612) per order

Ship Kit -QUIK-COMBO Therapy Cable; 2 rolls100mm
Paper; RC-4, Patient Cable, 4ft.; NIBP Hose, Coiled;

NIBP Cuff, Reusable, adult; 12-Lead ECG Cable, 4-Wire
Limb Leads, 5ft; 12-Lead ECG Cable, 6-Wire Precordial

attachment

LP 15 Lithium-ion Battery 5.7 amp hrs

LP15 AC Power Adapter (power cord not included)
AC power cord

Extension Cable (5ft 3 in)

Masimo™ ;RC Patient Cable - EMS, 4 FT.

Masimo™ Rainbow™ DCI Adult Reusable Sp02, SpCO,
SpMet Sensor, 3 FT. For use with RC Patient Cable,

LIFEPAK 15 NIBP Straight Hose, &'
NIBP Cuff-Reusable, Infant

NIBP Cuff-Reusable, Child

NIBP Cuff -Reusable, Large Adult
NIBP Cuff-Reusable, Adult X Large

1

Stryker Medical

P.O. Box 93308

Chicago, IL 60673-3308
JULIE SCHMITZ
julie.schmitz@stryker.com
5636767879
5636767879

Bill To Account

Name: MANITOWOC FIRE DEPT

Account #: 1168559

Address: 900 QUAY ST
MANITOWOC

Wisconsin 54220-4543

Qty Sell Price Total
1 $32,659.13 $32,659.13
1 $0.00 $0.00
2 $433.78 $867.56
1 $1,508.80 $1,508.80
1 $72.98 $72.98
1 $280.44 $280.44
1 $219.76 $219.76
1 $561.70 $561.70
1 $63.96 $63.96
1 $20.50 $20.50
1 $22.96 $22.96
1 $31.98 $31.98
1 $45.10 $45.10

Stryker Medical - Accounts Receivable - accountsreceivable@stryker.com - PO BOX 93308 - Chicago, IL 60673-3308




stryker

LP15

Quote Number:

Version:

Prepared For:

Quote Date:

Expiration Date:

14.0

15.0
16.0
17.0

19.0
20.0

10499198 Remit to:

1

MANITOWOC FIRE DEPT Rep:

Attn: Email:
Phone Number:
Mobile:

06/07/2022

09/05/2022

Product Description

11577-000002

11220-000028
11260-000039
11956-000471

11996-000090
11996-000093

Trade In Credit:

Product

TR-LP12B-LP15

ProCare Products:

#
18.0
21.1

Product
78000168
78000611

LIFEPAK 15 Basic carry case w/right & left pouches;

shoulder strap {11577-000001) included at no additional

charge when case ordered with a LIFEPAK 15 device
LIFEPAK 15 Carry case top pouch
LIFEPAK 15 Carry case back pouch

4G Modem: Verizon Cellular (for use on Stryker data
plan; purchased separately)

Electrode EDGE QUIK-COMBO RTS
Electrode EDGE QUIK-COMBO pediatric RTS

Description

TRADE-IN-STRYKER LIFEPAK 12B TOWARDS PURCHASE
OF LIFEPAK 15

Description
KORE - Stryker data plan for modem (Verizon)

ProCare LIFEPAK 15 Prevent Service: Annual onsite

preventive maintenance inspection and unlimited repairs

including parts, labor and travel for LIFEPAK 15 V4
Monitor/Defib - Manual & AED, Trending, Noninvasive
Pacing, Sp02, SpCO, NIBP, 12-Lead ECG, EtCO2, BT.
Incl at N/C: 2 pr QC Electrodes{511996»000091) &1
Test Load (21330-001365) per

(26500-003612) per order

2

evice, 1 Svc Manual CD

Stryker Medical

P.O. Box 93308

Chicago, IL 60673-3308
JULIE SCHMITZ
julie.schmitz@stryker.com
5636767879

5636767879

Qty Sell Price Total
1 $296.02 $296.02
1 $53.30 $53.30
i $76.26 $76.26
1 $1,056.98 $1,056.98
1, $40.18 $40.18
1 $40.18 $40.18
Equipment Total: $37,917.79
Qty Credit Ea. Total Credit
1 -$5,000.00 -$5,000.00
Qty  Sell Price Total
1 $320.00 $320.00
1 $6,383.50 $6,383.50
ProCare Total: $6,703.50

Stryker Medical - Accounts Receivable - accountsreceivable@strvker.com - PO BOX 93308 - Chicago, IL 60673-3308




stryker

LP15

Quote Number: 10499198

Version: 1

Prepared For: MANITOWOQC FIRE DEPT
Attn:

Quote Date: 06/07/2022

Expiration Date: 09/05/2022

Price Totals:

Prices: In effect for 30 days
Terms: Net 30 Days

Remit to:

Rep:

Email:

Phone Number:

Mabile:

Contact your local Sales Representative for more information about our flexible

payment options.

Stryker Medical

P.O. Box 93308

Chicago, IL 60673-3308
JULIE SCHMITZ
julie.schmitz@stryker.com
5636767879

5636767879

Estimated Sales Tax (0.000%):

Freight/Shipping:
Grand Total:

3
Stryker Medical - Accounts Receivable - accountsreceivable@strvker.com - PO BOX 93308 - Chicago, 1L 60673-3308

$0.00
$0.00
$39,621.29
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