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Deborah Neuser

From: Justin Nickels

Sent: Thursday, April 20, 2017 11:16 AM

To: Jim Muenzenmeyer

Cc: Jennifer Hudon; Deborah Neuser

Subject: FW: Car Ferry building

Attachments: Est_1052_from_Lees_Color_StudioElite_Concrete_Polishing._8632.pdf; ATTO0001.txt;

Justin M Nickels.vcf

Jennifer / Deborah,
Please add this to the Monday, April 24th council agenda under Finance.
Thanks.

- Justin

From: Jim Muenzenmeyer

Sent: Wednesday, April 19, 2017 10:56 AM
To: Justin Nickels

Cc: Dan Koski; Stacey Groll

Subject: Car Ferry building

The exterior of the car ferry building needs to be painted. $3,000. I'd like to offer to split it with LMC. Can you get our
share from room tax?
Thx - Jim



Lee's Color Studio/Elite Concrete Polishing.

Estimate
3401 Dewey Street

PO Box 418 Date Estimate #

Manitowoc, WI 54220

4/18/2017 1052
Name / Address Ship To
City of Manitowoc Car Ferry Ticket Office
Jim Muenzenmeyer
Project
Item Description Total
Painting 9900 Provide labor and materials for pressure washing, removing shutters, spot priming 1,700.00
and painting exterior block
Painting 9900 Provide labor and materials for pressure washing, spot priming, and painting the 350.00
South and West side soflits
Painting 9900 Provide labor and matenials for cleaning, priming and painting 9 columns 430.00
Pamnting 9900 Provide labor and materials for pamnting 2 walk doors and frames 200.00
Painting 9900 Provide labor and materials for cleaning, sanding, spol priming and painting hand 225.00
rails
Total $2,925.00
Phone # Fax # E-mail Web Site
920-684.7232 920.684-7236 info leescolorstudiof@yvahoo.com http:/ecscolorstudio.net




