18-089(,

Mackenzie Reed-Kadow

From: Kim Lynch

Sent: Tuesday, August 28, 2018 3:06 PM

To: Mackenzie Reed-Kadow; Deborah Neuser
Subject: FW: Restricted Cash Donation

Kim Lynch | Comptroller/Deputy Treasurer
City of Manitowoc

900 Quay Street

Manitowoc, WI 54220

(920) 686-6962

From: Steve Corbeille
Sent: Tuesday, August 28, 2018 3:04 PM

To: Karen Dorow <kdorow@manitowoc.org>

Cc: Justin Nickels <jnickels@manitowoc.org>; Dan Koski <dkoski@manitowoc.org>; Kim Lynch <klynch@manitowoc.org>
Subject: Re: Restricted Cash Donation

Approved. We should also add this donation and any others received as a regular report to the finance committee.

We can discuss later a mechanism to capture any and all of these so they can be reported to the committee/council.

Steve

Sent from my iPhone

On Aug 28, 2018, at 2:44 PM, Karen Dorow <kdorow@manitowoc.org> wrote:
Good Afternoon,
In accordance with our new donation policy, see below.

Chad is having Cretton do some work at the Dog Park at Indian Creek. Several citizens came forward
and offered to donate money towards this work. It is about $1,000 for the work and several citizens
gave checks that total $615.00. Please give your approval to accept the donation for the indian Creek
Dog Park work. | will hold the checks until | hear back from you.

Thank you.

Karen Dorow | Business Manager
City of Manitowoc

2655 S. 35t St.

Manitowoc, WI 54220

Office (920) 686-6514

Mobile (920) 374-0404



