Request Type: IUnbudgeted |

Department: |DPI - Engineering | Date: [10/18/2018

Title of Request: |Repair Memorial Drive Ponding/Water Drainage Issue

Department Priority  [Desirable |

Linked to another () Yes
project? @ No

Project Request is: (@) New Estimated Useful Life: |
O Replacement
O Modification

This is a limited field, please attach documents for more delail,

Description: [Install new 8" storm pipe & inlet in low spot on Memorial Dr. where it ponds after rain. |
Basis of Cost: ® Quote Total Cost  [$43:327-80— /%, ¢ |7
O Bid
O Estimate
Revenue (if any) [$0.00 | NetCost [$43:827:00 /5 (¢'7 |
Will there be additional costs in future years to complete this project?
select one: O Yes If yes, amount? | |
® No
Finance Dept: Account | | Sent to Dept: []

Action: | |
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CITY OF MANITOWOC

WISCONSIN, USA
www.mahitowoc.org

October 18, 2018

To: CAWG
From: Greg Minkel

RE: Ponding on Memorial Drive By West of the Lake Gardens

We received a request to repair Memorial Drive by West of the Lake Gardens due to water ponding
when it rains. This was taken to the PI Committee. They discussed it and would like it to be addressed
this year. They asked if it could be done by Streets crews if at all possible. Streets crews would not be
able to do this work during normal hours because of other work so if it is done this year it would be on
overtime on the weekend.

The committee asked us to get pricing and funding and bring it back to them for the November meeting.

Thank you,

DEPARTMENT OF PUBLIC INFRASTRUCTURE » 900 QUAY STREET, MANITOWOC, WI 54220
o, ENGINEERING (920) 686-6910 » STREETS 6z SANITATION (920) 686-6550 = PARKS (920) 686-3580 » CEMETERY (920) 6863570 o
\g’ FAX (920) 686-6906 = (920) 686-6525 =



Karen Dorow

e
From: Greg Minikel
Sent: Thursday, October 18, 2018 10:42 AM
To: Karen Dorow
Subject: FW: Memorial Drive puddle
Attachments: WESTLAKE_PUDDLE jpg; MEMORAIL_PUDDLE_2.pdf; MEMORAIL_PUDDLE_1.pdf
FYl:

From: Paul Steinbrecher [mailto:paul@smimanitowoc.comcastbiz.net]
Sent: Tuesday, September 04, 2018 9:30 AM

To: Marc Holsen; Greg Minikel

Cc: Don Cisler

Subject: Memorial Drive puddle

Marc and Greg

I’'m working with West of the Lake on a new parking lot. They asked me to contact you about a puddle on Memorial
Drive. | don’t know whose responsibility this is. The puddle is on the easterly side of the road about half way between
Reed and Magnolia. After rain storms there is close to 4” of water in the puddle and the puddle extends out to the
center of the 2 northbound lanes. Splash from the puddle covers the Mariners Trail and into the property of West of the
Lake. There is enough splash to send the cold mix from patching onto the trail. There are no inlets near the

puddle. There is a storm manhole behind the curb about 30’ south of the puddle.

Paul M. Steinbrecher, PE, PLS

SMI

102 Revere Drive

Manitowoc Wi 54220

920-684-5583 ext. 102 Cell 920-374-0379
www.smimanitowoc.com




Karen Dorow

From: Chad Scheinoha

Sent: Thursday, October 18, 2018 9:53 AM
To: Greg Minikel

Cc: Dan Koski; Mike Zimmer; Karen Dorow
Subject: RE: Message from "RNP002673A0BBIE"
Greg,

Here is our estimate to do this work. Overtime rates apply. Estimate includes all labor, equipment, and materials for
entire project. We would work a Saturday to do it if it has to be done this fall, but spring would be MUCH better. | really
don’t want to make a habit out of working OT to install new infrastructure. If this is the route that things may go in the
future we will need to make a push to hire another additional crew for sewer work. | know you don’t control that, but
just wanted to throw it out there.

Sewer - $4,500.00
Concrete Pavement -  $3,485.00
Curb and Gutter - $2,080.00
Asphalt Pavement - $1,662.00
Landscaping - $400.00
Misc. - $1,200.00
Total - $13,327.00

Chad J. Scheinoha

City of Manitowoc, Dept. of Public Infrastructure Operations Division Manager Mobile (920)374-0402 Office (920)686-
6512 www.manitowoc.org

-----0Original Message-----

From: Greg Minikel

Sent: Thursday, October 11, 2018 5:02 PM

To: Dan Koski; Mike Zimmer; Karen Dorow; Chad Scheinoha
Subject: FW: Message from "RNP002673A0BBSE"

Revised Proposal.

-—--—-0riginal Message—-—--

From: Kip Gulseth [mailto:kipgulseth@comcast.net]
Sent: Thursday, October 11, 2018 4:32 PM

To: Greg Minikel

Subject: FW: Message from "RNP002673A0BB9E"

-----0riginal Message-----

From: kipgulseth@comcast.net [mailto:kipgulseth@comcast.net]
Sent: Thursday, October 11, 2018 4:17 PM

To: Kip




¥i\Projocts\Claas X Noticun\2018\Storm Sewer Proposal for Mewmorial Dr. @ West of tha Lake
Rev. 10/5/18 G.J.M.
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for
., 8TORM SEWRRS
********f*****"***********************'k*****tﬁ**}

CITY OF MANITOWOC ,  PROJECT NO. WU~

BID UNIZ

- ITEM DESCRIPTION UNITS QUANTITY‘ PRICE TOTAL
Mobilisation 13 1 ;60 S& .m.
Traffic Contxol L8 1 6’@ (2 <y,

8" Btorm Sewer PVC (SDR-35) Ly ©45| 0L, 00 2,646 Y°
Type 3 Inlet ' Ba 1 Gie.® .| Q8™
Type H Casting (R-3067-R), Diagonal BA s, LS |
30" Concxete Curb & Gutter (Rem. & Repl.) P 80 sSC, O\ L[,SOL,%O
9" Concxete Bagse Course (Rem, & Repl.) sY - 47 (|12 .00 S'Z,C,U 0
3" HMA Pavement (Rem. & Ropl.) sy 471 C5.0™ 319G A
3" Topaoll, Beed & E-Mat 8y d OLICLC"S.
TOTAL PROJECT COST - lg CLH \0-6
: . )

Contractors:

renens a0 Cltlsed

oneor A&
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CITY OF MANITOWOC . PROJECT RO, WO~

. . BID UNIT -

. LTEM DESCRIPTION UNITS | QUANTITY PRICE TOTAL
Mobilization 18 $5,185.00} $5,185.00|
Traffic Contxol L8 $1,300.00 $1,300.00}
89 gtoxm Bewer PVC (HDR-35) LY 45 $80.50 * $3,622.50
Type 3 Inlet ™ 1 $1,900.00 $1,900.00
Type H Casting (R-3067-R), Diagonal BA 1 $580.00 $580.00
30¢ Conorete Curb & Gutter (Rem. & Repl.) 83 80 $54.00 $4,320.00}
9 Concrete Base Courxse (Rpm. & Repl..) 8y . 47 . $98.00 $4,600.00}
3 yMA Pavement (Rem. & Repl.) sY 47 $95.27 $4,477.69
3% Topooll, Seed & E-Mat oY 45 $28.33 $1,274.85]

TOTAL PROJECT COSY . $27,266.04
* Add $300 if Bond Required or for Change Order-

;':ant:aor,om . Vinton Construction Company

Printed Name: _Ronald Raboine, PE

8ignature: % %
4 .

pater __10/11/2018°




