18-1127

Sonja Birr

From: - ' Chad Scheinoha

Sent: Monday, November 05, 2018 10:50 AM

To: . Sonja Birr

Subject: Fwd: Badger Dock Quotes and Drawings ) )

Attachments: . EZVorronQuote(18).pdf; ATT00001.htm; EZDrawingVorron{18)OptionA.pdf; ATT00002.htm; EZDrawingVorron(18})

OptionB.pdf; ATT00003.htm; EZDrawingVorron(18)OptionC.pdf; ATTO0004.htm

Sent from my iPhone

Begin forwarded message:

From: BARBARA VORRON <barbvorron@hotmail.com>
Date: November 4, 2018 at 8:00:03 PM CST

To: Chad Scheinoha <cscheinoha@manitowoc.org>
Subject: Fwd: Badger Dock Quotes and Drawings

Begin forwarded message:

From: cammarata cammarata <badgerdocks@yahoo.com>
Date: November 4, 2018 at 5:11:33 PM CST

To: "barbvorron@hotmail.com" <barbvorron@hotmail.com>
Subject: Badger Dock Quotes and Drawings

Barb

attached are the quotes and drawings of your proposed Dock/Kayak launch. Please
review and if you have any questions don't hesitate to ask or call John at: (262) 305-
9735. '

Thanks

Jim Cammarata
Badger Docks and Lifts
(262)305-3913




Option: A

1-80”x 10’ EZDock Dock Section w/ {6) Connection Couplers

2- Anchor Assemblies includes: (2) 2”x10’ Galv. Pipe, (2) HD Pipe Bracket & Couplers, & (2) Pipe Auger
1-5’x12’ ADA Aluminum Gangway |

1-Hinge, AIuminuvm Gangway to 60” Float

1-Residential Kayak Launch

- 1-Shipping from Mfg.
Cost
Option: B

2-80”x 10’ EZDock Dock Section w/ (6) Connection Couplers

4- Anchor Assemblies includes: (2) 27x10’ Galv. Pipe, {2) HD Pipe Bracket & Couplers, & (2) Pipe Auger

1-5'x12’ ADA Aluminum Gangway
1-Hinge, Aluminum Gangway to 60” Float
1-Residential Kayak Launch
6-_Connecti6n Couplers

1-Shipping from Mfg.

Cost

2460.00
894.00
2708.06
475.00
1545.00

650.00

$8,732.00+tax

4560.00
1788.00
2708.00

475.00

1545.00

360.00

650.00

$12,086.00+tax



Option:C

1-Kit EZLaunch ’;Drive Thru” Includes: Transfer bench, Dock Sections and Curbing 20,354.00
4- Anchor Assemblies Includes: (2) 2"x10’ Galv. Pipe, (2) HD Pipe Bracket & Couplers, & (2) Pipe Auger 1788.00
1-5'x12’ ADA Aluminum Gangway 2708.06
1-Hinge, Aluminum Gangway to 60” Float ‘ 475.00
1-Shipping from Mfg. 650.00

Cost ‘ $25,975.00
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Proposal

Name »
Z?W/ZA SR P.O. Box 222
Address ) Jackson, Wi 53037
— f 262-305-9735
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ACCEPTANCE OF PhOPOSAL ~The above drawing(s), specifications, and ditensions are
satisfactary and are hereby accepted, You are authotized to do the work as specified.
| have read and understand the terms and conditlons on the back of the proposal.

Date of Acceptance:

Payment will be made as outlined on proposal. Customer Signature:,
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ACCEPTANCE OF PROPOSAL - The above drawing(s), specifications, and dimensions are Date of Acceptance:

satisfactory and are hereby accepted. You are authorized to do the work as specified.
I have read and understand the terms and conditions on the back of the proposal.
Customer Signature:

Payment will be made as outlined on proposal.




Proposal
Nam7?22 oy M? ) P.0. Box 222

Address Jackson, Wl 53037

Py, - VA ey D 262-305-9735

262-305-3913

] o Y = W

badgerdocks@yahoo.com
BADGER DOCKBLLO >

ACCEPTANCE OF PROPOSAL - The above drawing(s), spectfications, and dimenslons are
satisfactory and are hereby accapted. You are authorized to do the work as specified,

[ have read and understand the terms and conditions on the back of the proposal.
Payment will be made as outlined on proposal. Custorner Signature;

Date of Acceptance:




Return To: Sandy - Parks

Event: L@Keshore Holiday Parade ~ EventDate: 11-21-18

DPOLICE

(686-6500)

REVIEWING DEPARTMENT RECOMMENDATION

DEPT. CHARGES
LABOR OTHER _

EQUIP. TOTAL

- Dept. Head or Designee Name i Date / /

FIRE A

(686-6500)

DEPT. CHARGES
LABOR N/A OTHER N/A

EQuip. N/A - - TOTAL N/A

Dept.-Head or. Designee NameTOdd M. Blaser Date 11 / 05 / 18

|—__] PARKS

(686-3580)

DIVISION CHARGES ' FEES DUE BY ORGANIZER
RENTAL LATE APPL. FEE

OTHER | - STAKE PERMIT
TOTAL TOTAL

Dept. Head or Designee Name, Date / /

REC.
(686-3060)

DIVISION. CHARGES
RENTAL

OTHER
TOTAL

Dept. Head or Designee Name Date / /

|:|STREETS

(686-6550)

DIVISION CHARGES
RENTAL

OTHER
TOTAL

Dept. Head or Designee Name Date I




