TO:

FROM:

SUBIJECT:

CITY OF MANITOWOC

WISCONSIN, USA

WWW. manitowoc.org

March 8, 2019

Mayor and Common Council
Board of Public Works

Appeal for snow removal assessment for property at 904 N. 9" St.

Dear Mayor and Common Council:

At the March 6, 2019 Board of Public Works meeting, the Board met to review the appeal for a

th

snow removal assessment for the property at 904 N. 9 St.

“Property owner Maureen Crowley was present to explain her situation.

Moved by Alderman Lee Kummer, seconded by Alderman Mike Williams, and unanimously

carried to reduce the assessment by $150.00. Ayes, 7. Nays, none.”

Very Truly Yours,

Sba l 7 Do

DEBORAH NEUSER
Secretary Board of Public Works

Deborah Neuser, CMC, City Clerk

CITY HALL - 900 Quay Street - Manitowoc, WI 54220-4543

Phone (920) 686-6950 - Fax (920) 686-6959 - dneuser@manitowoc.org



Sonja Birr

From: Stacey Groll

Sent: Monday, March 04, 2019 2:16 PM
To: Sonja Birr

Subject: FW: Snow removal fine

Stacey L. Groll

Assistant to Mayor Justin M. Nickels

City Hall | 900 Quay Street | Manitowoc, WI 54220
920.686.6980 | sgroll@manitowoc.org
www.manitowoc.org

“Be mindful. Be grateful. Be positive. Be true. Be kind.” - Roy T. Bennett

The information contained in this message is confidential. It is intended only for the use of the individual or entity
identified above. If the receiver of this message is not the intended recipient, you are hereby notified that
reading, distribution, use, or copying of this message is strictly prohibited. If you have received this message in
error, please immediately notify the sender by replying to the address noted above and delete the message.
Thank you.

Become a Fan on "WW
| Facebook i @ J Gwﬂm, o

‘Like' the City of Manitowoc Facebook Follow the City of Manitowoc on
page by clicking the image above! Twitter by clicking the image above!

From: Justin N|cke!s

Sent: Sunday, March 03, 2019 12:19 PM
To: Stacey Groll

Subject: Fwd: Snow removal fine

Begin forwarded message:

From: "Crowley, Maureen" <maureen.crowley@uwc.edu>
Date: March 2, 2019 at 7:34:06 PM CST

To: "jnickels@manitowoc.org" <jnickels@manitowoc.org>
Subject: Snow removal fine

Hi Justin,

[ received a bill today from the city for snow removal, but I"d like to explain the circumstances—
and appeal.



I left on February 8th to go out of town for 12 days. The company that has removed my snow
for years told me in mid November that they were retiring. 1 desperately sought someone else
which was almost impossible at that late date. I hired one person who did it a few times and then
stopped coming. Just before I left, I hired another person who removed the snow at that time and
promised he’d take care of it while I was gone. Ihad no access to email for a week, but found
out later that he never came back. Jeff Brown (Catherine Leone’s husband) and Al White
noticed this then came over and removed the snow. In fact, Al sent me a picture of the cleared
sidewalks on the 18th. I returned on the 20th and saw the sidewalks had been shoveled.

On the 21st, Catherine Leone dropped me off in front of my driveway and I noticed two
strangers, a man and woman, spreading something on a section of my sidewalk. As I approached
them to ask who they were, they turned and walked quickly away to a truck across the street
(with the Eco sign). I waited to talk to them, but they drove away. I called a third person and
have hired him and so far, he’s shown up and done the job (Will Schmidt).

I was surprised to get the city bill, as the snow had been cleared before they came on the
21st. I'd like to ask you to reconsider the fine imposed.

If you have any questions, please contact me.

Maureen Crowley
686-1990

Sent from my iPad
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8535

Sidewalk snow removal violation and removal form

City of Manitowoc

Department of Public Infrastructure

Location: 904 N 9TH ST

Complaint Date: 2/20/2019 12:00:00 AM

Parcel Number: 585003010 (Lot #9460)

Complainant Name:

Owner Name: CROWLEY MAUREEN, (Cust #38940)

Complainant Phone:

Owner Address: 904 N 9TH ST MANITOWOC, WI 542203361

Subsequent Complaint (circle if applicable)
If circled proceed to 2" inspection and removal

Initial inspection date: 2/19/19

| Inspector: BH

Action taken: (circle one) GIVEN TO CONTRACTOR

Date issue @len to contractor: 2/20/19

COMP INSP INSP COMPLIANCE
DATE INITIALS YES ORNO
SHOVELED

EMPLOYEE

LABOR

EQUIP | EQUIP
HRS

DATE
BILLED

MINIMUM
CHARGE

ADDITIONAL
CHARGES

CJs C:\Users\sreilly\AppData\Local\Temp\CM20190220041454.sbw  3/4/2019




8535

City of Manitowoc

Department of Public Infrastructure

Sidewalk snow removal violation and removal form

Location: 904 N 9TH ST

Complaint Date: 2/20/2019 12:00:00 AM

Parcel Number: 585003010

(Lot #9460)

Complainant Name:

Owner Name: CROWLEY MAUREEN,

(Cust #38940)

Complainant Phone:

Owner Address: 904 N 9TH ST MANITOWOC, WI 542203361

Subsequent Complaint (circle if applicable)
If circled proceed to 2™ inspection and removal

T

Initial inspection datef 2/19/19/

| Inspector: BH

Action taken: (circle ohe}—"

GIVEN TO CONTRACTOR

Date issue given to contractor: 2/20/19

COMP INSP INSP COMPLIANCE | EMPLOYEE | LABOR | EQUIP | EQUIP DATE MINIMUM | ADDITIONAL
DATE INITIALS YES OR NO HRS HRS BILLED CHARGE CHARGES
SHOVELED
(2211 ‘ NI Vakr | Febal 11 01 5
2-21-1% Mo M Y AN | Bobiatr | Ky RAbag s
[
CJS C:\Users\sreilly\AppData\Local\Temp\CM20190220041454.sbw  2/20/2019




