Mackenzie Reed-Kadow

From: Kathleen McDaniel

Sent: Thursday, December 12, 2019 9:34 AM

To: '‘Marianne Erdman’; Elizabeth Majerus

Cc: Jane Rhode: Mackenzie Reed-Kadow; Steve Corbeille

Subject: RE: [Potential Spam] Claim for damages to Hedge at 856 North 13th St. Manitowoc WI
Ms. Erdman,

At this point, our office will reach out to the involved departments and gather documentation, then make a
recommendation to the Finance Committee because your prayer for relief exceeds $5,000. Their next meeting
is set for January 7, 2020.

Kathleen M. McDaniel

Manitowoc City Attorney

900 Quay Street, Manitowoc, WI 54220
(920) 686-6990 | kmcdaniel@manitowoc.org

From: Marianne Erdman [mailto:manitowocmarianne@gmail.com]

Sent: Monday, December 02, 2019 12:57 PM

To: Kathleen McDaniel; Elizabeth Majerus

Subject: Re: [Potential Spam] Claim for damages to Hedge at 856 North 13th St. Manitowoc WI

Kathleen,

Thank you for getting back to me so quickly. A signed copy with the bottom portion of the form has been
dropped olf today.

Please let me know wha the next step is and approximately how long it takes.
Thank you,
Marianne Erdman

On Tue. Nov 26. 2019 at 10:26 AM Marianne Erdman <manitowocmarianne(@gmail.com™> wrote:

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: Kathleen MeDaniel <kmcdaniel@manitowoc.org>

Date: Mon, Nov 25, 2019 at 5:47 PM

Subject: RE: [Potential Spam] Claim for damages to Hedge at 856 North 13th St. Manitowoc WI

To: Marianne Erdman <manitowocmarianne(@gmail.com>, Elizabeth Majerus <emajerus@manitowoc.org>
Cec: Jane Rhode <jrhode@manitowoc.org>, Deborah Neuser <dneuser@manitowoc.org>




Ms. Erdman,

. . . . <
| received your Notice of Circumstances of Claim. Before | can take any action, a signed copy will need to be
filed with the Clerk, which can be done in person or via mail. If you’re intending to seek immediate relief at
this point, rather than put the City on notice, you will also need to complete the bottom portion of the form.

Kathleen M. McDaniel
Manitowoc City Attorney

900 Quay Street, Manitowoc, WI 54220

(920) 686-6990 | kmcdaniel@manitowoc.org

From: Marianne Erdman [mailto:manitowocmarianne@gmail.com}
Sent: Monday, November 25, 2019 10:09 AM

To: Kathleen McDaniel; Elizabeth Majerus
Subject: [Potential Spam] Claim for damages to Hedge at 856 North 13th St. Manitowoc WI

Kathleen,

Following are before and after photos of the hedge. Attached are copies of the estimates.

Jerry at Lakeland also sent a revised estimate via email as follows:

Staggering the plants would not change the number of plants. It would widen the planting bed
a bit which would require more mulch and topsoil than a straight line planting. The cost to do

6' plants would be $2,912.00 plus tax of 145.60 ($3,057.60).
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Please let me know if you need any additional information. I can be reached via email

or 920-6841365.

Thank you.

Marianne Erdman







