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Kim Lynch

From: Kim Lynch
Sent: Thursday, September 23, 2021 8:09 AM
To: Dan Koski; Nick Reimer; Todd Blaser; Greg Vadney; Jeremy Walvoord; Shawn Alfred; Adam Tegen
Subject: FW: Concrete/Asphalt at DPW shop
Attachments: 202109230610.pdf

TrackingTracking: Recipient Response
Dan Koski
Nick Reimer Approve: 9/27/2021 2:12 PM
Todd Blaser Approve: 9/27/2021 12:00 PM
Greg Vadney
Jeremy Walvoord Approve: 9/23/2021 2:17 PM
Shawn Alfred Approve: 10/1/2021 8:19 AM
Adam Tegen Approve: 9/27/2021 7:41 AM

There was a net surplus of $13,190 from the sale of these two pieces of equipment. 
 
Use the voting buttons above. 
 
This will need to go to Finance and PI committees.  Please respond asap so this can go on the October committee 
agendas. 
 
Thanks! 
 
Kim Lynch  |  Comptroller/Deputy Treasurer City of Manitowoc 
900 Quay Street 
Manitowoc, WI 54220 
(920) 686‐6962 
 
 
 
‐‐‐‐‐Original Message‐‐‐‐‐ 
From: Jeremy Walvoord <jwalvoord@manitowoc.org> 
Sent: Thursday, September 23, 2021 5:49 AM 
To: Kim Lynch <klynch@manitowoc.org>; Shawn Alfred <salfred@manitowoc.org> 
Cc: Dan Koski <dkoski@manitowoc.org> 
Subject: FW: External: DPW scanner 
 
Good Morning All 
 
I would like to use some of the funds from the sale of old #73 and #78 tandem dump trucks on Gov. Deals web site to 
pay for the concrete and asphalt repairs at the DPW shop. I have a not to exceed $10,000.00 for these projects.  
 
This payment will go directly back to the streets department budget lines.  
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These repairs are for the dugout areas for the new fuel pumps electrical replacement. And also to install the concrete 
footings for the new cat walk system at the DPW shop. Both of these projects concrete and asphalt were not figured in 
the original budget.  
 
 Thanks 
Jeremy Walvoord 
Building and Grounds 
Fleet, & Lift bridges 
Division Manager 
City of Manitowoc 
920‐374‐0403 Cell 
920‐686‐6513 Office 
920‐686‐6525 Fax 
jwalvoord@manitowoc.org 
 
 
 
 
 


